
 [External Email]

From: Hill, Shannon
To: Downtown West Project
Subject: FW: NOD Posting Request: Downtown West Mixed-Use Plan (Google Project)
Date: Thursday, May 27, 2021 4:18:36 PM
Attachments: SCCSVUFRPS52_REC_MFD_BUSINESS_1005_001.pdf

ORDER_126002285_27May2021132420PDT.pdf

 
 
Shannon Hill
Planner, Environmental Review
Planning, Building & Code Enforcement
City of San José |
200 East Santa Clara Street
Shannon.Hill@sanjoseca.gov
|
(408) 535 - 7872
 

From: Fader, Elaine <elaine.fader@rec.sccgov.org> 
Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 1:26 PM
To: Hill, Shannon <Shannon.Hill@sanjoseca.gov>; Keyon, David <david.keyon@sanjoseca.gov>
Cc: bus-rdc <bus-rdc@rec.sccgov.org>
Subject: RE: NOD Posting Request: Downtown West Mixed-Use Plan (Google Project)
 
 

 

Hello Shannon,
 
Please see the attached for a soft copy of the CEQA filing.
 
A hard copy will be mailed to your attention.
 
Best Regards,
 
Elaine Fader
Clerk-Recorder’s Office
Office Specialist II
County of Santa Clara
elaine.fader@rec.sccgov.org
 
 
 

From: bus-rdc <bus-rdc@rec.sccgov.org>

Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 11:59 AM
To: Fader, Elaine <elaine.fader@rec.sccgov.org>
Cc: Shannon.Hill@sanjoseca.gov;
david.keyon@sanjoseca.gov
Subject: FW: NOD Posting Request: Downtown West Mixed-Use Plan (Google Project)
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Santa Clara County Recorder - Official Records
70 West Hedding St.
San Jose, CA 95110


408-299-5688


Source: Phone Order (Card Keyed-In) Authorization: Paid in Full
Order Date/Time: 5/27/2021 01:11 PM PDT Agency Amount: $3495.25
Order Number: 126002285 Other Agency Amount: $0.00
Operator: ElaineF Shipping Amount: $0.00
Location Code: *********615 LN Service Fee: $2.50


Total Amount(USD): $3497.75


Payment Information
Transaction Type: Purchase Expiration ##/##
Card Holder: Bhavesh Parikh Transaction Ref #: 119813599
Payment Method: Credit Card (VISA ************4125) CVV2 Response:
Approval Code: 005747 Auth Txn Id #: 58114772752197


AVS Response: Val Code: 5GHD
Merchant Copy


Agency Amount Product Product Detail
$3495.25 Clerk Payment


-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------


Santa Clara County Recorder - Official Records
70 West Hedding St., San Jose, CA 95110


408-299-5688
VitalChek Receipt - Phone Order (Card Keyed-In)


Cardholder Copy


Order Date/Time: 5/27/2021 01:11 PM PDT Transaction Type: Purchase
Confirmation Number: 126002285 Approval Code: 005747
Payment Applied towards: Clerk Payment Transaction Ref #: 119813599
Card Holder: Bhavesh Parikh Payment Method: VI(4125)


Bill To
Bhavesh Parikh
United States of America


Authorization: Paid in Full
Agency Amount: $3495.25
Other Agency Amount: $0.00
LN Service Fee: $2.50
Total Amount(USD): $3497.75
Refund Policy: Please contact the agency listed on the receipt to request a
refund.







Importance: High
 
Hello Elaine,

Can you please review and process the email request below?
 
CEQA filings are filed within 24 hours of receipt.
 
Thank you,
Laura Luna
 

From: ClerkRecorder <ClerkRecorder@rec.sccgov.org>

Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 10:16 AM
To: bus-rdc <bus-rdc@rec.sccgov.org>
Subject: FW: NOD Posting Request: Downtown West Mixed-Use Plan (Google Project)
Importance: High
 
 
 

From: Hill, Shannon <Shannon.Hill@sanjoseca.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 9:54 AM
To: ClerkRecorder <ClerkRecorder@rec.sccgov.org>
Cc: Keyon, David <david.keyon@sanjoseca.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] NOD Posting Request: Downtown West Mixed-Use Plan (Google Project)
Importance: High
 
Hello,
 
Please refer to the attached County cover sheet and NOD for the subject project.
 
Payment of the fees will be by credit card. Please call the applicant contact, Bhavesh Parikh, at (858)
750-0060. He will provide payment information.
 
Also, please reply with confirmation of payment, so we can file with the State Clearinghouse as well.
 
Thanks!
 
Shannon Hill
Planner, Environmental Review
Planning, Building & Code Enforcement
City of San José |
200 East Santa Clara Street
Shannon.Hill@sanjoseca.gov
|
(408) 535 - 7872
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This message is from outside the City email system. Do not open links or attachments from untrusted
sources.

 



















Santa Clara County Recorder - Official Records
70 West Hedding St.
San Jose, CA 95110

408-299-5688

Source: Phone Order (Card Keyed-In) Authorization: Paid in Full
Order Date/Time: 5/27/2021 01:11 PM PDT Agency Amount: $3495.25
Order Number: 126002285 Other Agency Amount: $0.00
Operator: ElaineF Shipping Amount: $0.00
Location Code: *********615 LN Service Fee: $2.50

Total Amount(USD): $3497.75

Payment Information
Transaction Type: Purchase Expiration ##/##
Card Holder: Bhavesh Parikh Transaction Ref #: 119813599
Payment Method: CVV2 Response:
Approval Code: 005747 Auth Txn Id #: 58114772752197

AVS Response: Val Code: 5GHD
Merchant Copy

Agency Amount Product Product Detail
$3495.25 Clerk Payment

-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Santa Clara County Recorder - Official Records
70 West Hedding St., San Jose, CA 95110

408-299-5688
VitalChek Receipt - Phone Order (Card Keyed-In)

Cardholder Copy

Order Date/Time: 5/27/2021 01:11 PM PDT Transaction Type: Purchase
Confirmation Number: 126002285 Approval Code: 005747
Payment Applied towards: Clerk Payment Transaction Ref #: 119813599
Card Holder: Bhavesh Parikh Payment Method:

Bill To
Bhavesh Parikh
United States of America

Authorization: Paid in Full
Agency Amount: $3495.25
Other Agency Amount: $0.00
LN Service Fee: $2.50
Total Amount(USD): $3497.75
Refund Policy: Please contact the agency listed on the receipt to request a
refund.




